

1 **AEGIS LAW FIRM, PC**  
2 Kashif Haque, State Bar No. 218672  
3 Jessica L. Campbell, State Bar No. 280626  
4 9811 Irvine Center Drive, Suite 100  
5 Irvine, California 92618  
6 Telephone: (949) 379-6250  
7 Facsimile: (949) 379-6251

8 Attorneys for Plaintiff SUHAIL FARRAN

9 **SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE OF CALIFORNIA**  
10 **COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES**

11 DANIEL MARKO, JESUS CORONA,  
12 CYNTHIA MARCIANO, DAVID CRISTINI,  
13 DARNELL AUSTIN, MANUEL MAGANA,  
14 JARED ROUSSEL, SUHAIL FARRAN,  
15 DANA LOWE, MILOS ANTIC, KEVIN  
16 SAUNDERS, and BRANDON CAMPBELL,

17 Plaintiffs,

18 v.

19 DOORDASH, INC.,

20 Defendant.

Case No.: BC659841

*Assigned for all purposes to:  
Hon. Judge Amy D. Hogue  
Dept.: 7*

**DECLARATION OF JESSICA L. CAMPBELL  
IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR FINAL  
APPROVAL OF CLASS ACTION  
SETTLEMENT**

1 I, Jessica L. Campbell, hereby declare as follows:

2 1. I am an attorney at law licensed to practice before all of the courts of the State of  
3 California. I am a Partner at Aegis Law Firm, PC, counsel for Plaintiff Suhail Farran (“Plaintiff”) in  
4 this matter. I am thoroughly familiar with and have personal knowledge of all of the facts set forth  
5 herein.

6 2. I submit this declaration in support of Plaintiffs’ Motion for Final Approval of Class  
7 Action Settlement. If called as a witness, I could and would competently testify thereto.

8 **Counsel’s Qualifications**

9 3. Aegis Law Firm, PC (“Aegis” or “Aegis Law Firm”), prosecutes wage and hour cases,  
10 including class actions on behalf of employees and others who have had their rights violated. Aegis, either  
11 on its own, or with co-counsel is currently serving as plaintiffs’ counsel of record in dozens of wage and  
12 hour and employment class action cases pending in both state and federal court.

13 4. The attorneys working on this case have been appointed class counsel in many cases,  
14 through both contested motions and settlement approval motions.

15 5. Aegis has litigated and successfully resolved many wage and hour class action cases  
16 involving failure to pay wages and derivative Labor Code claims and penalties. *See, e.g., Bonello v. Lab*  
17 *Express.*, San Bernardino Superior Court, Case No. CIVDS1714584 (class certification granted on May  
18 14, 2021 for all current and former employees classified as independent contractors on issues of business  
19 expenses reimbursements and failure to furnish accurate wage statements to employees); *Roman, et al.*  
20 *v. TRM Manufacturing, Inc.*, Riverside Superior Court, Case No. RIC1706458 (class certification granted  
21 on December 17, 2020 for all current and former non-exempt workers on issues of rounding, meal period,  
22 and rest period claims); *Gamboa v. Kamran, et al.*, San Bernardino Superior Court, Case No.  
23 CIVDS1605273 (class certification granted on September 16, 2019, for factory workers on issues of  
24 rounding, automatic deduction of first meal period, and second meal period); *Romo, et. al, v. GMRI, Inc.*  
25 *d/b/a/ Olive Garden*, United States District Court Central District of California, Case No. EDCV-12-  
26 0715-JLQ (class certification granted for restaurant workers’ rest period claims); *Sawyer v. Retail Data,*  
27 *LLC*, Orange County Superior Court, Case No. 30-2014-00753767-CU-OE-CXC (unpaid wage and rest  
28 break claims for piece rate workers); *Gonzalez v. SFFI Company, Inc., et. al*, San Bernardino County

1 Superior Court, Case No. CIV DS1504287 (unpaid wages, meal period and rest break claims for non-  
2 exempt employees); *Antoine v. Riverstone Residential California, Inc., et. al*, Sacramento County  
3 Superior Court, Case No. 34-2013-00155974 (rate of pay, on-call time, unpaid wage, meal period, rest  
4 break, and expense reimbursement claims for non-exempt employees); *Nguyen v. Pharmerica*, Orange  
5 County Superior Court, Case No. 30-2014-00716072-CU-OE-CXC (unpaid wages and unreimbursed  
6 expenses for pharmacists); *Orellana v. Westlake*, Los Angeles County Superior Court, Case No.  
7 BC539614 (unpaid overtime, meal period and rest break claims for call center employees); *Kent v.*  
8 *Mountain View Child Care, Inc.*, Los Angeles County Superior Court, Case No. BC539633 (minimum  
9 wage, overtime, meal period, and rest break claims for hospital workers); *Durroh v. East West Bank*,  
10 Los Angeles County Superior Court, Case No. BC528860 (overtime claims for failure to include  
11 bonuses in regular rate of pay for bank workers); *O'Brien et al. v. Pizza Hut of Southeast Kansas, Inc.*  
12 *et al.*, Riverside County Superior Court, Case No MCC 1301030 (meal period and expense  
13 reimbursement claims for delivery drivers); *Bell v. Prime Healthcare*, Orange County Superior Court,  
14 Case No. 30-2011-00475240-CU-OE-CXC (overtime claims for failure to include shift premiums in  
15 regular rate of pay and failure to provide meal and rest periods to hospital workers), *Grana v. Toys R*  
16 *US-Delaware, Inc.*, Central District of California, Case No. 2:13-cv-01302-DSF-JCG (bag check claims  
17 for unpaid wages and failure to provide meal periods and rest breaks to retail employees); *Mendez v.*  
18 *H.J. Heinz Company, L.P., et. al*, Orange County Superior Court, Case No. 30-2013-00644915-CU-OE-  
19 CXC (failure to pay all wages to factory workers due to rounding practice); *Fresh & Easy Wage and*  
20 *Hour Cases*, Los Angeles Superior Court, Cas No. JCCP 4705 (failure to provide meal and rest periods  
21 to supermarket workers); *Lunsford v Stater Bros.*, Riverside Superior Court, Case No. RIC 1104475  
22 (failure to provide meal and rest periods to supermarket workers); *Gregg v. Belo*, Riverside Superior  
23 Court, Case No. RIC 523697 (unpaid wages and missed meal and rest periods due to misclassification  
24 of newspaper delivery employees); *Brown v. Experian Information Solutions, Inc., et. al.*, Orange  
25 County Superior Court, Case No. 30-2012-00375163 (misclassification of engineers and similar  
26 positions); *Tereth v. Shakey's USA, Inc.*, Los Angeles Superior Court, Case No. BC441359 (failure to  
27 provide meal and rest periods to restaurant employees); *Azurin v. Harbor Distributing LLC, et. al.*, Los  
28 Angeles Superior Court, Case No. BC421392 (failure to pay overtime wages, provide meal and rest

1 periods, reimburse business expenses to Account Managers); *Caffero v. ABC* (failure to provide meal  
2 periods and reimburse expenses of therapists). All cases cited above were successfully resolved for the  
3 plaintiff classes.

4 6. Kashif Haque received his J.D. in 2001 from Washington University School of Law. While  
5 in law school, Mr. Haque was a member of the Law Review Editorial Board, author of an article published  
6 in the Law Review, Executive Board Member of Moot Court, and a member of the Dean's List. He  
7 received a Bachelor's of Science in Business Administration from the University of Central Missouri in  
8 1998, where he was a member of the Beta Alpha Psi honors fraternity.

9 7. Since 2004, Mr. Haque has exclusively focused his practice on plaintiff's employment  
10 litigation with a specific focus on wage and hour claims. Since then, he has represented over 500,000  
11 employees with their employment claims, many of which included wage and hour claims. He has been  
12 appointed class counsel in approximately 100 cases and is currently litigating over 150 employment wage  
13 and hour class action cases.

14 8. Mr. Haque authored a book on employment litigation strategies with West Publishing and  
15 has been invited to speak on class action and wage and hour issues on numerous occasions. He has spoken  
16 at seminars by the State Bar of California, California Employment Lawyer's Association (CELA), Orange  
17 County Bar Association, and various other CLE providers. Mr. Haque is the former Chair for the Labor  
18 and Employment Section of the Orange County Bar Association. He was selected as one of the Top 50  
19 Attorneys in Orange County by Super Lawyers for 2017 and 2019. He has been a Super Lawyer for every  
20 year from 2009 to the present. OC Register/Metro has selected him as one of the Top 5 Employment  
21 Lawyers in Orange County for every year the list was published, from 2012 to 2018. Mr. Haque currently  
22 bills at a rate of \$785 per hour.

23 9. I am a partner at Aegis Law Firm. I was admitted to the California Bar in December of  
24 2011, and received my J.D. from Santa Clara University School of Law and my B.A. from the University  
25 of California, Berkeley. I have dedicated my career to plaintiffs'-side class actions. My experience  
26 includes successful work on class action appeals, class certification motions, and class settlements. I  
27 was chosen by Law and Politics Magazine as a Super Lawyer Rising Star, representing one of the top  
28 2.5% of lawyers under 40 in Southern California in 2018 and 2019. My billing rate is \$650 per hour.



17. While we fought these arbitration issues, we continued to investigate claims, interview witnesses, and talk to other potential class or PAGA representatives about joining the case. We eventually joined the settlement with the other cases.

18. Aegis spent 341.9 hours working on this case, resulting in \$202,827.50 in attorneys' fees. The chart below summarizes the tasks completed by each attorney.

	Kashif Haque	Samuel Wong	Jessica Campbell	Suren W.	Daniel Hyun	Shelly Song
Pleadings	4.1	1	8.3	5	2	8.7
Investigation and discovery	20	14.7	20.1	1.9	10.9	0.6
Client Communications	1.2		5.8	2.7	5.6	
First Arbitration Motion	0.4		15.3		3.9	7.6
Second Arbitration Motion	4.3		2.8	23.1		
Supplemental Briefing on Arbitration Motion	8.2		20		31.2	
Motions - Other	20	1.5	9.8	21	3.6	1.8
Court Appearances			1.9	9.7	3.8	
Appeal	2.6		1.8	7.3	6.2	
Mediation and Settlement	4.8	2.7	8.9	5.1		
<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>65.6</b>	<b>19.9</b>	<b>94.7</b>	<b>75.8</b>	<b>67.2</b>	<b>18.7</b>
<b>Billing Rate</b>	<b>\$785</b>	<b>\$785</b>	<b>\$650</b>	<b>\$525</b>	<b>\$400</b>	<b>\$400</b>
<b>Fees</b>	<b>\$ 51,496.00</b>	<b>\$ 15,621.50</b>	<b>\$ 61,555.00</b>	<b>\$ 39,795.00</b>	<b>\$ 26,880.00</b>	<b>\$ 7,480.00</b>

19. Our time and tasks as the attorneys on this case did not further Mr. Farran's individual claims but rather the collective claims that were ultimately settled because at the outset of the case, we decided to fight the arbitration agreement only for representative claims – class claims under Business and Professions Code Section 17200 and PAGA claims. Even at the initial investigation stage, we were aware of the arbitration agreement, and we researched how to beat it for the class members and PAGA employees, not for Mr. Farran individually. In fact, Mr. Farran dismissed his individual claims and forewent individual arbitration to keep the PAGA action active and avoid a stay on those claims.

20. A true and correct copy of Aegis' detailed billing records is attached hereto as **Exhibit A**.

21. Aegis spent a total of \$7,139.36 in costs litigating this case. A true and correct copy of

1 Aegis' cost report is attached hereto as **Exhibit B**.


2

3 I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California and the United States  
4 that the foregoing is true and correct.

5 Executed on September 17, 2021 at Irvine, California.

6

7

  
\_\_\_\_\_  
Jessica L. Campbell

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

# EXHIBIT A



Aegis Law Firm  
Lodestar Report

Date	Task	Atty	Hours	Rate	Fees
5/3/2018	MTG w/client re potential case	KH	3.2	\$ 785.00	\$ 2,512.00
5/3/2018	Research re company and claims, meeting with SW re same	KH	2.9	\$ 785.00	\$ 2,276.50
5/3/2018	Met with K. Haque regarding potential case, reviewed Dasher agreement with arbitration clause, research re potential defenses to arbitration	SW	4.6	\$ 785.00	\$ 3,611.00
5/5/2018	Reviewed client documents, further research re proving independent contractor claims for delivery drivers	KH	3.5	\$ 785.00	\$ 2,747.50
5/7/2018	Meeting w/SW re case	KH	0.9	\$ 785.00	\$ 706.50
5/7/2018	Further research re arbitration agreement, saved notes to file, met with K. Haque re recommendation to file	SW	2.8	\$ 785.00	\$ 2,198.00
5/10/2018	MTG w/KH and SS re drafting complaint and LWDA letter, reviewed docs from client	JC	2.8	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,820.00
5/10/2018	MTG w/JC and SS re new case	KH	1	\$ 785.00	\$ 785.00
5/10/2018	Meeting re case assignment, drafted complaint, sent to JC for review	SS	3.5	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,400.00
5/11/2018	Drafted memo re research for KH, meeting re complaint filing	JC	4.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 2,860.00
5/11/2018	edited complaint, MTG w/SS re same	JC	0.9	\$ 650.00	\$ 585.00
5/11/2018	Reviewed and revised complaint, assigned further research	KH	0.7	\$ 785.00	\$ 549.50
5/12/2018	reviewed draft LWDA letter, gave feedback, reviewed research memo	KH	1.4	\$ 785.00	\$ 1,099.00
5/12/2018	drafted LWDA letter	SS	1.1	\$ 400.00	\$ 440.00
5/12/2018	Made edits to LWDA letter, submitted for further review	SS	0.5	\$ 400.00	\$ 200.00
5/16/2018	edited LWDA letter, MTG w/SS re same	JC	0.6	\$ 650.00	\$ 390.00
5/16/2018	MTG w/JC re edits to LWDA letter, finalized letter and sent to staff for submission	SS	0.8	\$ 400.00	\$ 320.00
5/17/2018	Sent check to LWDA for filing fee	SW	0.1	\$ 785.00	\$ 78.50
6/6/2018	corr w/OPC	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
6/7/2018	emails with defense counsel	SS	0.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 80.00
6/8/2018	met w/SS re outcome of call w/OPC	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
6/8/2018	call with OPC, confirming email re same, MTG w/JC re outcome	SS	0.4	\$ 400.00	\$ 160.00
6/12/2018	Met w/KH re related case	JC	0.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 260.00
6/12/2018	Reviewed complaint and docket from related case, met w/JC re same	KH	1.1	\$ 785.00	\$ 863.50
6/12/2018	corr w/OPC	SS	0.1	\$ 400.00	\$ 40.00
6/15/2018	responded to OPC email	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
6/20/2018	Research re acceptance issue for motion to compel arb	SS	2.3	\$ 400.00	\$ 920.00
6/20/2018	reviewed indep k agree, research re same	JC	2.5	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,625.00

Aegis Law Firm  
Lodestar Report

Date	Task	Atty	Hours	Rate	Fees
6/20/2018	Corr with counsel for first-filed case	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
6/20/2018	reviewed removal papers from Magana	KH	0.6	\$ 785.00	\$ 471.00
6/20/2018	MTG re indep k agree	KH	0.6	\$ 785.00	\$ 471.00
6/20/2018	MTG re indep k agree	SS	0.6	\$ 400.00	\$ 240.00
6/21/2018	Met w/SS re response to OPC email	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
6/21/2018	Met with JC and responded to defense counsel's email re arb	SS	0.3	\$ 400.00	\$ 120.00
6/22/2018	Research re authenticating electronic acceptance of arb agreement	JC	1.9	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,235.00
6/22/2018	Reviewed email and doc from OPC re electronic acceptance, met with JC re same	SS	0.4	\$ 400.00	\$ 160.00
6/22/2018	Met w/SS re new docs	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
6/22/2018	Further corr with co-counsel	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
6/26/2018	Further corr with co-counsel	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
6/27/2018	reviewed new Taylor complaint, research re related cases, met with KH re same	JC	2.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,495.00
6/27/2018	Met w/JC re related cases	KH	0.7	\$ 785.00	\$ 549.50
6/29/2018	Drafted FAC and stip re FAC	SS	0.9	\$ 400.00	\$ 360.00
7/2/2018	Reviewed draft stip	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
7/3/2018	reviewed MTC arb, MTG w/SS and KH	JC	1.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 845.00
7/3/2018	Research re responding to petition vs motion, searched for templates, sent to SS	JC	3.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 2,080.00
7/3/2018	Met w/JC and SS re arb petition	KH	0.4	\$ 785.00	\$ 314.00
7/3/2018	drafted PAGA only CMP	JC	0.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 260.00
7/3/2018	reviewed peremptory challenge motion and supporting papers	KH	0.4	\$ 785.00	\$ 314.00
7/4/2018	drafted opp to petition	SS	2.8	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,120.00
7/8/2018	Revised opp to petition	JC	0.8	\$ 650.00	\$ 520.00
7/9/2018	Case meeting	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
7/9/2018	Edited draft email	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
7/9/2018	MTG w/JC re need to contact OPC again about PAGA	SS	0.3	\$ 400.00	\$ 120.00
7/9/2018	emailed OPC re adding PAGA	SS	0.1	\$ 400.00	\$ 40.00
7/9/2018	Drafted response email for JC review	SS	0.4	\$ 400.00	\$ 160.00
7/10/2018	Reviewed research re petition, emailed SS re same	JC	0.9	\$ 650.00	\$ 585.00
7/10/2018	drafted Motion for leave to amend	SS	1.8	\$ 400.00	\$ 720.00
7/13/2018	edited MLA	JC	0.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 260.00
7/14/2018	research re Epic Systems and Iskanian issue	JC	3.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 2,145.00
7/16/2018	further research re 558 issues raised by OPC in email	JC	2.9	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,885.00
8/7/2018	Met w/SS re moving hearing	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
8/7/2018	Reviewed stip to move hearing, met with JC re same	SS	0.4	\$ 400.00	\$ 160.00
8/8/2018	reviewed notices of related cases	KH	0.2	\$ 785.00	\$ 157.00
8/11/2018	drafted opp MTC	SS	0.8	\$ 400.00	\$ 320.00

Aegis Law Firm  
Lodestar Report

Date	Task	Atty	Hours	Rate	Fees
8/15/2018	phone call with court clerk re reassignment and rescheduling hearings, emailed OPC re same	SS	0.4	\$ 400.00	\$ 160.00
8/17/2018	Met w/SS re Def delay of hearings	JC	0.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 260.00
8/17/2018	MTG w/JC, corr w/OPC re same	SS	0.5	\$ 400.00	\$ 200.00
8/22/2018	Further email with OPC re hearing dates	SS	0.1	\$ 400.00	\$ 40.00
8/23/2018	Met w/SS re OPC email, next steps	JC	0.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 260.00
8/24/2018	Met with JC and KH re reassignment of case	DH	0.5	\$ 400.00	\$ 200.00
8/24/2018	MTG re related cases	JC	0.5	\$ 650.00	\$ 325.00
8/24/2018	MTG re related cases	KH	0.5	\$ 785.00	\$ 392.50
9/5/2018	starting drafting ex parte opp, met with SS re same	DH	2.3	\$ 400.00	\$ 920.00
9/5/2018	MTG w/DH re ex parte	JC	0.9	\$ 650.00	\$ 585.00
9/5/2018	Reviewed draft opposition to ex parte	KH	0.8	\$ 785.00	\$ 628.00
9/6/2018	attended ex parte	DH	1.7	\$ 400.00	\$ 680.00
9/6/2018	MTG re ex parte outcome	DH	0.9	\$ 400.00	\$ 360.00
9/6/2018	MTG re ex parte outcome	KH	0.9	\$ 785.00	\$ 706.50
9/7/2018	edited opp to MTC arb, research	DH	3.9	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,560.00
9/16/2018	MTG w/SS re case status and deadlines	DH	0.5	\$ 400.00	\$ 200.00
10/15/2018	drafted suppl briefing	DH	3.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,280.00
10/16/2018	continued drafting suppl brief, research	DH	4.9	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,960.00
10/19/2018	edited suppl briefing	JC	4.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 2,665.00
10/21/2018	research re 17200 arb	DH	2.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 880.00
10/21/2018	MTG re 17200 research	KH	0.9	\$ 785.00	\$ 706.50
10/30/2018	edited opp to MTC arb	DH	4.5	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,800.00
10/30/2018	research re arb petitions in other doordash cases	JC	3.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 2,015.00
10/31/2018	drafted withdrawal of MLA	DH	0.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 80.00
11/1/2018	edited opp to MTC arb	JC	2.5	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,625.00
11/5/2018	checked docket, corr re notice of withdrawal	DH	0.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 80.00
11/7/2018	corr re motion off calendar	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
11/14/2018	MTG and hearing prep	DH	1.9	\$ 400.00	\$ 760.00
11/14/2018	MTG w/DH re hearing prep	JC	0.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 260.00
11/15/2018	corr w/OPC re moving hearing again	DH	0.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 80.00
11/15/2018	Reviewed notice of ruling	KH	0.1	\$ 785.00	\$ 78.50
11/20/2018	reviewed stip to continue, MTG w/DH re same	JC	0.5	\$ 650.00	\$ 325.00
11/21/2018	edited stip to continue	DH	0.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 80.00
12/10/2018	corr w/AD re hearing moved	DH	0.1	\$ 400.00	\$ 40.00
12/11/2018	corr re new dealdines for supplemental brief	DH	0.1	\$ 400.00	\$ 40.00
12/29/2018	MTG w/JC, drafted opp	DH	2.6	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,040.00
12/29/2018	reviewed Def brief, MTG w/DH re opp	JC	1.9	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,235.00
1/2/2019	corr re new hearing date	DH	0.1	\$ 400.00	\$ 40.00
1/6/2019	drafted suppl opp	DH	1.8	\$ 400.00	\$ 720.00
1/9/2019	edited suppl opp	DH	0.6	\$ 400.00	\$ 240.00
1/9/2019	Reviewed and revised supplemental brief	KH	1.5	\$ 785.00	\$ 1,177.50

Aegis Law Firm  
Lodestar Report

Date	Task	Atty	Hours	Rate	Fees
1/15/2019	Reviewed New Prime case, notes re bearing on case	SW	1.5	\$ 785.00	\$ 1,177.50
1/25/2019	MTG w/DH re many hearing continuances	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
1/28/2019	edited stip to continue	DH	0.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 80.00
1/28/2019	drafted further suppl opp	DH	1.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 480.00
1/31/2019	Prepared for and held phone call with JC re suppl opp	DH	1.3	\$ 400.00	\$ 520.00
1/31/2019	Reviewed briefing for MTG w/DH, met w/DH re briefing by phone	JC	2.5	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,625.00
2/1/2019	Edited suppl opp	DH	2.9	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,160.00
2/1/2019	Corr w/co-c re briefing on opp to mtc arb	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
2/3/2019	edited further supp opp	JC	1.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 715.00
2/6/2019	Emails with potential witness	DH	0.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 80.00
2/6/2019	Corr from witness, corr with DH re same	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
2/8/2019	Conducted interview with witness, sent notes to JC	DH	1.8	\$ 400.00	\$ 720.00
2/9/2019	Reviewed notes from call with witness, set meeting with KH and DH re same	JC	0.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 260.00
2/11/2019	Emails with potential witness	DH	0.1	\$ 400.00	\$ 40.00
2/11/2019	MTG w/KH re witness	JC	0.8	\$ 650.00	\$ 520.00
2/11/2019	Met with JC and DH re witness interview	KH	0.8	\$ 785.00	\$ 628.00
2/12/2019	corr w/JC re witness	DH	0.1	\$ 400.00	\$ 40.00
2/12/2019	Met with JC, called witness again	DH	0.8	\$ 400.00	\$ 320.00
2/12/2019	Meeting with DH re witness	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
2/13/2019	Emails with potential witness	DH	0.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 80.00
2/13/2019	Phone call with potential witness	DH	0.6	\$ 400.00	\$ 240.00
3/6/2019	MTG and hearing prep	DH	2.4	\$ 400.00	\$ 960.00
3/6/2019	MTG w/DH and KH re hearing prep	JC	1.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 845.00
3/6/2019	MTG re potential arguments at hearing	KH	1.3	\$ 785.00	\$ 1,020.50
3/6/2019	Reviewed tentative ruling, MTG w/KH re same	SW	1.4	\$ 785.00	\$ 1,099.00
3/7/2019	attended hearing	DH	2.1	\$ 400.00	\$ 840.00
3/7/2019	corr with witness and Evelyn	DH	0.5	\$ 400.00	\$ 200.00
3/7/2019	MTG re outcome of hearing	DH	1.5	\$ 400.00	\$ 600.00
3/7/2019	MTG re outcome of hearing	JC	1.5	\$ 650.00	\$ 975.00
3/7/2019	MTG re outcome of hearing	KH	1.5	\$ 785.00	\$ 1,177.50
3/8/2019	corr re hearing transcript	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
3/11/2019	research re writ	DH	5.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 2,080.00
3/11/2019	MTG re writ research	JC	1	\$ 650.00	\$ 650.00
3/13/2019	MTG re writ research	DH	1	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00
3/13/2019	TC w/potential addit rep	DH	1.4	\$ 400.00	\$ 560.00
3/13/2019	Met w/JC re rep issues	KH	1	\$ 785.00	\$ 785.00
3/13/2019	MTG with DH and KH	JC	1	\$ 650.00	\$ 650.00
3/17/2019	Corr with potential addit rep	DH	0.1	\$ 400.00	\$ 40.00
3/19/2019	Reviewed email with potential rep, met with KH re same	DH	0.6	\$ 400.00	\$ 240.00
3/19/2019	Met with DH re new issues from potential rep	KH	0.5	\$ 785.00	\$ 392.50

Aegis Law Firm  
Lodestar Report

Date	Task	Atty	Hours	Rate	Fees
3/20/2019	TC w/potential addit rep	DH	0.9	\$ 400.00	\$ 360.00
3/20/2019	MTG re additional rep	DH	0.4	\$ 400.00	\$ 160.00
3/20/2019	MTG re additional rep	JC	0.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 260.00
3/22/2019	Research re dashcam issues	DH	4.6	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,840.00
3/25/2019	Further corr w/potential rep	DH	0.1	\$ 400.00	\$ 40.00
3/25/2019	Meeting [privilege/work product]	DH	0.6	\$ 400.00	\$ 240.00
3/25/2019	Meeting [privilege/work product]	JC	0.6	\$ 650.00	\$ 390.00
3/25/2019	Meeting [privilege/work product]	KH	0.6	\$ 785.00	\$ 471.00
3/25/2019	Corr w/KH re seeking reconsideration, reviewed case	JC	0.8	\$ 650.00	\$ 520.00
3/25/2019	Met w/SW re new case law	KH	1	\$ 785.00	\$ 785.00
3/25/2019	Reviewed Nieto v. Fresno case, MTG w/KH re requesting reconsideration	SW	1.5	\$ 785.00	\$ 1,177.50
3/26/2019	Further corr w/potential rep	DH	0.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 80.00
3/27/2019	Reviewed communications with potential rep, met with JC re same	KH	0.8	\$ 785.00	\$ 628.00
3/27/2019	Meeting with KH re case	JC	0.7	\$ 650.00	\$ 455.00
3/28/2019	Further call with potential addit rep	DH	1.1	\$ 400.00	\$ 440.00
3/29/2019	Reviewed email from potential rep re additional issues, forwarded to JC and KH	DH	0.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 80.00
3/30/2019	Research re tip issues, ratings issues	KH	3.8	\$ 785.00	\$ 2,983.00
4/2/2019	Meeting with KH re potential additional issues for case	JC	0.9	\$ 650.00	\$ 585.00
4/2/2019	Met w/JC re tip issues	KH	0.9	\$ 785.00	\$ 706.50
4/16/2019	TC w/potential addit rep	DH	0.4	\$ 400.00	\$ 160.00
4/16/2019	TC w/Farran	DH	0.4	\$ 400.00	\$ 160.00
4/16/2019	MTG re whether to add rep	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
4/16/2019	Met w/JC	KH	0.3	\$ 785.00	\$ 235.50
4/18/2019	research re venue in PAGA cases, filing in LA	KH	2.9	\$ 785.00	\$ 2,276.50
4/22/2019	drafted PAGA only CMP for LA	DH	0.4	\$ 400.00	\$ 160.00
5/3/2019	Reviewed intake for new additional rep, corr re same	KH	0.4	\$ 785.00	\$ 314.00
5/8/2019	drafted drop ltr to potential rep	DH	0.2	\$ 400.00	\$ 80.00
5/8/2019	drafted req to dismiss class case	DH	0.9	\$ 400.00	\$ 360.00
5/13/2019	edited req to dismiss	JC	0.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 260.00
5/30/2019	reviewed Def Obj to dismissal	KH	0.4	\$ 785.00	\$ 314.00
5/30/2019	Commenced preparation of Opposition to Defendant's Objection to Request for Dismissal of Claim and Individual Claims without Prejudice.	SNW	1.5	\$ 525.00	\$ 787.50
5/31/2019	MTG w/SNW	JC	0.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 260.00
5/31/2019	Met with JC re case status and strategy--re Defendant's Objection to Request for Dismissal.	SNW	0.4	\$ 525.00	\$ 210.00

Aegis Law Firm  
Lodestar Report

Date	Task	Atty	Hours	Rate	Fees
5/31/2019	Began preparing Opposition to Objection to Request for Dismissal. Research re cases saying court cannot prohibit a Defendant from dismissing claims ordered into arb. via trial court.	SNW	4.9	\$ 525.00	\$ 2,572.50
6/3/2019	research re obj to dismissal	JC	2.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,560.00
6/5/2019	Emailed OPC re serving PAGA complaint	SNW	0.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 52.50
6/6/2019	Continued preparation of Response to Objection to Client's Request for Dismissal.	SNW	2.3	\$ 525.00	\$ 1,207.50
6/7/2019	Revised response to objection	KH	1.3	\$ 785.00	\$ 1,020.50
6/7/2019	Completed preparation of Response to Objection to Request for Dismissal.	SNW	1.4	\$ 525.00	\$ 735.00
6/10/2019	Reviewed edits, finalized Response to Objection	SNW	0.3	\$ 525.00	\$ 157.50
6/18/2019	Served Defendant by NAR, corr re same	SNW	0.2	\$ 525.00	\$ 105.00
6/26/2019	Reviewed tentative ruling, met with SNW re hearing strategy	KH	0.7	\$ 785.00	\$ 549.50
6/26/2019	Reviewed and analyzed Court's tentative ruling on Request for Dismissal and Defendant's Objection to the same. Prepared correspondence to opposing counsel re same. Prepared for hearing.	SNW	1.5	\$ 525.00	\$ 787.50
6/27/2019	Prepared for and attended hearing on Request for Dismissal.	SNW	3.5	\$ 525.00	\$ 1,837.50
7/2/2019	email with OPC re extension	SNW	0.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 52.50
7/3/2019	further email re extension	SNW	0.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 52.50
7/5/2019	Case meeting	JC	1	\$ 650.00	\$ 650.00
7/5/2019	Met w/Suren re dismissal hearing outcome	KH	1	\$ 785.00	\$ 785.00
7/5/2019	Meeting with JC and KH re dismissal hearing, next steps	SNW	1	\$ 525.00	\$ 525.00
7/8/2019	Prepared written discovery to Defendant.	SNW	1.9	\$ 525.00	\$ 997.50
7/10/2019	Research and prepared correspondence to opposing counsel re futility of Defendant's threatened Motion to Compel Arbitration.	SNW	2.9	\$ 525.00	\$ 1,522.50
7/11/2019	Reviewed and analyzed Defendant's response to Client's position re demurrer. Prepared correspondence to Defendant's counsel re the same.	SNW	0.9	\$ 525.00	\$ 472.50
7/11/2019	Meeting w/Suren re emails re arb of PAGA case	KH	1.3	\$ 785.00	\$ 1,020.50
7/11/2019	Case meeting with KH	SNW	1.3	\$ 525.00	\$ 682.50
7/16/2019	Reviewed, analyzed, and revised stipulation to continue CMC.	SNW	0.2	\$ 525.00	\$ 105.00

Aegis Law Firm  
Lodestar Report

Date	Task	Atty	Hours	Rate	Fees
7/22/2019	Communications with OPC re going to move to compel arbitration of the PAGA issue, claiming that the the dispute over independent contractor status must be arbitrated, and claiming that our complaint still seeks individual relief. We will oppose.	SNW	0.3	\$ 525.00	\$ 157.50
7/24/2019	research re tip practices for doordash and other vendors (grubhub, instacart, postmates), emailed Suren re same	JC	2.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,430.00
7/24/2019	Prepared amended LWDA letter. Prepared correspondence to opposing counsel re same. Met with JC re same.	SNW	1.4	\$ 525.00	\$ 735.00
8/2/2019	Reviewed MTC arb, met with SNW re same	JC	1.8	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,170.00
8/2/2019	Reviewed and analyzed Defendant's Petition to Compel Arb. Prepared correspondence to OC re the same. Discussed the same with JC.	SNW	2.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 1,102.50
8/13/2019	Prepared Response to Petition to Compel Arbitration.	SNW	0.5	\$ 525.00	\$ 262.50
8/13/2019	Reviewed exhibits to Motion to Compel Arb, research	SNW	1.6	\$ 525.00	\$ 840.00
8/22/2019	Research re lack of assent to electronic agreement	SNW	2.6	\$ 525.00	\$ 1,365.00
8/26/2019	Reviewed draft of Opp to Motion to Compel, send revisions to Suren	KH	2.3	\$ 785.00	\$ 1,805.50
8/26/2019	Continued preparation of Opposition to Motion to Compel Arbitration.	SNW	1.8	\$ 525.00	\$ 945.00
9/2/2019	Continued preparation of Opposition to Motion to Compel Arbitration.	SNW	3.2	\$ 525.00	\$ 1,680.00
9/3/2019	Continued preparation of Opposition to Motion to Compel Arbitration.	SNW	3.6	\$ 525.00	\$ 1,890.00
9/4/2019	Prepared correspondence to opposing counsel re hearing on Defendant's Motion to Compel Arbitration. Left voice message for counsel re the same.	SNW	0.2	\$ 525.00	\$ 105.00
9/10/2019	Completed preparation of Opposition to Petition to Compel Arbitration/Stay Case.	SNW	4.5	\$ 525.00	\$ 2,362.50
9/17/2019	Prepared correspondence to opposing counsel re hearing on Defendant's Petition to Compel Arbitration.	SNW	0.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 52.50
9/23/2019	Prepared correspondence to opposing counsel re itemization of Defendant's costs in Class Action case.	SNW	0.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 52.50
9/23/2019	Reviewed tentative ruling, MTG w/SNW re same	JC	1	\$ 650.00	\$ 650.00
9/23/2019	Reviewed reply brief	KH	0.7	\$ 785.00	\$ 549.50

Aegis Law Firm  
Lodestar Report

Date	Task	Atty	Hours	Rate	Fees
9/23/2019	Met with JC re Court's tentative ruling and strategy in contesting tentative ruling.	SNW	1.3	\$ 525.00	\$ 682.50
9/24/2019	Met w/Suren re outcome of hearing, potential appeal	KH	0.9	\$ 785.00	\$ 706.50
9/24/2019	Conducted legal research re petitions for writs of rulings on motion to stay, and related legal issues.	SNW	3.8	\$ 525.00	\$ 1,995.00
9/24/2019	Attended hearing on Defendant's Petition to Compel Arbitration.	SNW	5.5	\$ 525.00	\$ 2,887.50
9/26/2019	Continued preparation of Petition for Writ of Mandate.	SNW	1.7	\$ 525.00	\$ 892.50
9/30/2019	Case meeting	JC	0.6	\$ 650.00	\$ 390.00
9/30/2019	Met w/JC and SNW	KH	0.6	\$ 785.00	\$ 471.00
9/30/2019	Met with JC and KH re strategy for adding new tip conversion claim to current case and strategy in seeking writ of Court's ruling staying PAGA case.	SNW	0.6	\$ 525.00	\$ 315.00
10/1/2019	Conducted legal research for Petition for Writ based on ruling granting Motion to Stay.	SNW	1.8	\$ 525.00	\$ 945.00
10/24/2019	Case meeting	JC	0.8	\$ 650.00	\$ 520.00
10/24/2019	Met w/JC and SNW	KH	0.8	\$ 785.00	\$ 628.00
10/24/2019	Met with KH and JC re cost issues.	SNW	0.8	\$ 525.00	\$ 420.00
10/25/2019	Case meeting	JC	1.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 715.00
10/25/2019	Research re cost recovery in voluntary dismissal	KH	2.9	\$ 785.00	\$ 2,276.50
10/25/2019	Met w/JC and SNW	KH	1.1	\$ 785.00	\$ 863.50
10/25/2019	Met with JC and KH re issue of taxing Door Dash's costs. Prepared correspondence to KH re same.	SNW	1.4	\$ 525.00	\$ 735.00
10/29/2019	case meeting	JC	0.9	\$ 650.00	\$ 585.00
10/29/2019	Email from counsel in related case, met with JC re same	SW	0.9	\$ 785.00	\$ 706.50
10/30/2019	Reviewed SW email re ballot initiative, saved notes to file	KH	0.6	\$ 785.00	\$ 471.00
10/30/2019	Reviewed article about Doordash funded ballot initiative, research re bill language and impact on case, corr w/KH re same	SW	3.9	\$ 785.00	\$ 3,061.50
10/30/2019	Met with KH re mediation and consolidation issues. Prepared further correspondence to Plaintiff Marko's counsel re the same.	SNW	0.4	\$ 525.00	\$ 210.00
10/30/2019	Reviewed emails re consolidation	KH	0.2	\$ 785.00	\$ 157.00
10/30/2019	Exchange multiple e-mail correspondence with Plaintiff's Counsel in Marko case re consolidation.	SNW	0.4	\$ 525.00	\$ 210.00
11/4/2019	Met with JC re related cases	KH	0.8	\$ 785.00	\$ 628.00
11/4/2019	MTG w/KH re consolidation	JC	0.8	\$ 650.00	\$ 520.00



Aegis Law Firm  
Lodestar Report

Date	Task	Atty	Hours	Rate	Fees
11/5/2019	Prepared correspondence to opposing counsel re settling costs in class action case.	SNW	0.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 52.50
11/11/2019	Met with SNW	KH	0.5	\$ 785.00	\$ 392.50
11/11/2019	Met with KH re case status and strategy.	SNW	0.5	\$ 525.00	\$ 262.50
11/12/2019	Meeting re stay issue	KH	0.6	\$ 785.00	\$ 471.00
11/12/2019	Conferred with KH re lifting stay on case, consolidating with first-filed case against Door Dash, and settlement issues. Prepared correspondence to first-to-file Plaintiff's Counsel re same.	SNW	0.6	\$ 525.00	\$ 315.00
11/15/2019	Meeting w/KH and staff re appeal	JC	0.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 260.00
11/15/2019	Reviewed notice of appeal, team meeting re deadlines	KH	0.4	\$ 785.00	\$ 314.00
11/27/2019	Reviewed record for appeal, reviewed file for any items to augment record	KH	1.3	\$ 785.00	\$ 1,020.50
12/6/2019	Prepared correspondence to opposing counsel re tolling of tip withholding claim, negotiating costs in class action case, and stay of PAGA case.	SNW	0.4	\$ 525.00	\$ 210.00
12/9/2019	Finalized Stipulated Order Dismissing Class and Individual Claims Without Preudice. Prepared correspondence to opposing counsel re the same.	SNW	0.4	\$ 525.00	\$ 210.00
12/10/2019	Phone call with client from other case re participation in doordash arbitrations, reviewed email from Troxel Law re same	JC	1.5	\$ 650.00	\$ 975.00
12/11/2019	Meeting w/KH re doordash arbitrations	JC	0.5	\$ 650.00	\$ 325.00
12/11/2019	Met w/JC re individual arbs	KH	0.5	\$ 785.00	\$ 392.50
12/13/2019	Email to co-counsel	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
12/13/2019	Case meeting	JC	1	\$ 650.00	\$ 650.00
12/13/2019	Met w/JC and SNW	KH	1	\$ 785.00	\$ 785.00
12/13/2019	Met with JC and KH re strategy in intervening in current settlement.	SNW	1	\$ 525.00	\$ 525.00
12/13/2019	Reviewed stip to dismiss	KH	0.2	\$ 785.00	\$ 157.00
12/17/2019	Prepared for and attended MPA hearing in Marciano v. Door Dash.	SNW	0.5	\$ 525.00	\$ 262.50
12/19/2019	Phone call with co-counsel re settlement, corr w/KH and SNW re same	JC	0.8	\$ 650.00	\$ 520.00
12/20/2019	Met with SNW re outcome of hearing	KH	0.3	\$ 785.00	\$ 235.50
12/20/2019	Met with KH re hearing debrief	SNW	0.3	\$ 525.00	\$ 157.50
12/23/2019	Corr w/co-c re settlement	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
12/24/2019	Corr w/ JC re settlement	SNW	0.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 52.50
12/27/2019	Reviewed case file history, emails with KH and SNW re settlement discussions	JC	0.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 260.00
12/30/2019	emailed co-c re history of our case, procedural issues, appeal	JC	0.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 260.00

Aegis Law Firm  
Lodestar Report

Date	Task	Atty	Hours	Rate	Fees
12/31/2019	Corr w/co-c re settlement	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
1/3/2020	MTG w/KH	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
1/3/2020	Further corr w/co-c re settlement	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
1/3/2020	Met with JC re settlement	KH	0.3	\$ 785.00	\$ 235.50
1/6/2020	Corr w/other co-counsel	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
1/6/2020	Received email from Adrian Bacon, asked JC to respond	KH	0.1	\$ 785.00	\$ 78.50
1/9/2020	Phone call with Adrian Bacon, corr re same	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
1/10/2020	MTG w/KH re outcome of call	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
1/10/2020	Met w/JC re co-counseling agreement	KH	0.2	\$ 785.00	\$ 157.00
1/29/2020	Attended Status Conference.	SNW	0.7	\$ 525.00	\$ 367.50
2/11/2020	Reviewed email from SW re individual arbs in SF, saved notes to file	KH	0.5	\$ 785.00	\$ 392.50
2/11/2020	Reviewed article about Doordash arbitrations, Judge Alsup decision, reviewed docs from SF case, corr w/KH re same	SW	2.9	\$ 785.00	\$ 2,276.50
3/18/2020	Case meeting	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
3/18/2020	Met with JC re case status.	SNW	0.3	\$ 525.00	\$ 157.50
3/31/2020	Checked status of Marciano MPA hearing.	SNW	0.2	\$ 525.00	\$ 105.00
4/2/2020	sent client update	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
4/13/2020	reviewed draft joint statement, approved for filing	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
6/1/2020	Checked docket for Marciano MPA Hearing.	SNW	0.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 52.50
6/4/2020	Corr w/co-counsel re client dec for MPA	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
6/5/2020	Telephone conference with Co-Counsel re MPA and settlement. Prepared correspondence to Client re same.	SNW	0.2	\$ 525.00	\$ 105.00
6/6/2020	Telephone conference with Client re settlement and declaration. Prepared declaration. Prepared correspondence to Client re same.	SNW	1.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 577.50
6/8/2020	Met w/SNW re settlement agreement	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
6/8/2020	Reviewed and analyzed settlement agreement. Conferred with JC re same. Prepared multiple correspondence to co-counsel re same.	SNW	1.2	\$ 525.00	\$ 630.00
6/8/2020	Reviewed additional revisions to Settlement Agreement. Executed the same. Prepared correspondence to Defendant's Counsel re same.	SNW	0.3	\$ 525.00	\$ 157.50
6/11/2020	Telephone conference with Client re declaration.	SNW	0.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 52.50
6/16/2020	Phone call with client, mailed declaration	SNW	0.3	\$ 525.00	\$ 157.50
6/22/2020	Prepared correspondence to Client and Co-Counsel re Client's declaration ISO MPA.	SNW	0.3	\$ 525.00	\$ 157.50
6/22/2020	Conferred with JC re case status and strategy.	SNW	0.3	\$ 525.00	\$ 157.50

Aegis Law Firm  
Lodestar Report

Date	Task	Atty	Hours	Rate	Fees
6/23/2020	Conferred with co-counsel re settlement status. Prepared multiple correspondence to Client re same. Prepared correspondence to JC re same.	SNW	0.4	\$ 525.00	\$ 210.00
6/26/2020	Prepared correspondence to Co-Counsel re Client's declaration ISO MPA.	SNW	0.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 52.50
6/30/2020	Corr w/co-c re client dec	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
7/6/2020	Prepared correspondence to Defendant's Counsel re OSC.	SNW	0.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 52.50
7/13/2020	MTG w/DG re checking court hearing dates for LA and SF case	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
7/24/2020	Reviewed and analyzed revised class settlement agreement and executed the same; and prepared correspondence to co-counsel re same.	SNW	0.3	\$ 525.00	\$ 157.50
7/24/2020	Prepared correspondence to co-counsel re settlement.	SNW	0.2	\$ 525.00	\$ 105.00
8/11/2020	Telephone conference with Defendant's Counsel re upcoming OSC re dismissal.	SNW	0.2	\$ 525.00	\$ 105.00
8/12/2020	Reviewed and analyzed stip. to continue OSC. Prepared correspondence to Defendant's Counsel re same.	SNW	0.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 52.50
8/24/2020	corr re hearing continuance	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
9/1/2020	Reviewed email re outcome of latest hearing, MTG w/KH re same	JC	0.6	\$ 650.00	\$ 390.00
9/1/2020	Meeting w/JC re case status	KH	0.5	\$ 785.00	\$ 392.50
9/11/2020	Reviewed article re doordash FLSA minimum wage claims, sent notes to KH	SW	0.5	\$ 785.00	\$ 392.50
9/15/2020	Prepared correspondence to Client re case status	SNW	0.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 52.50
9/18/2020	reviewed draft joint statement, approved for filing	SNW	0.1	\$ 525.00	\$ 52.50
9/22/2020	Email from co-counsel re mini mediation	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
10/8/2020	reviewed stip and order to continue hearing, corr re same	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
10/21/2020	Corr re hearing continued	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
10/30/2020	Reviewed email from co-c re revisions to deal, reviewed new draft	JC	0.6	\$ 650.00	\$ 390.00
11/2/2020	Reviewed and analyzed Revised Class Settlement Agreement. Executed same. Prepared correspondence to Co-Counsel re same.	SNW	0.6	\$ 525.00	\$ 315.00
11/4/2020	Communications with client	SNW	0.2	\$ 525.00	\$ 105.00
11/18/2020	Reviewed draft status report, email re same	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
12/3/2020	Communications with client	SNW	0.2	\$ 525.00	\$ 105.00
12/7/2020	Corr re client signature on settlement	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00

Aegis Law Firm  
Lodestar Report

Date	Task	Atty	Hours	Rate	Fees
12/8/2020	reviewed case status, client correspondence, emailed co-counsel doc requested	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
12/29/2020	Reviewed stip to continue OSC, corr re same	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
1/6/2021	Reviewed amendment to settlement, send signature	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
1/14/2021	checked court docket, hearing still on calendar, set up LACourtConnect	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
1/15/2021	prepared for and attended OSC hearing, email re outcome	JC	0.9	\$ 650.00	\$ 585.00
1/21/2021	checked Marciano docket, updated notes	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
1/21/2021	reviewed joint report for appellate court, approved for filing	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
3/9/2021	Meeting with JC re case status	KH	0.2	\$ 785.00	\$ 157.00
3/9/2021	reviewed draft joint stip, approved for filing	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
3/22/2021	reviewed joint report for appellate court, approved for filing	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
4/1/2021	corr w/co-counsel re changes to settlement, MTG w/KH re same	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
4/1/2021	Met with JC re revisions to settlement	KH	0.2	\$ 785.00	\$ 157.00
4/5/2021	Reviewed revised settlement, updated client	JC	0.8	\$ 650.00	\$ 520.00
4/6/2021	Reviewed additional revisions to settlement, updated client	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
4/12/2021	Corr re client signature on settlement	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
4/16/2021	Reviewed supplemental briefing	KH	0.9	\$ 785.00	\$ 706.50
4/20/2021	reviewed draft joint stip, approved for filing	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
4/28/2021	attended CMC	JC	0.7	\$ 650.00	\$ 455.00
5/6/2021	corr re potential referral of additional doordash rep	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
5/21/2021	client update	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
5/21/2021	reviewed joint report for appellate court, approved for filing	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
6/2/2021	corr w/co-c re additional declarations	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
6/9/2021	client communications re declaration	JC	0.8	\$ 650.00	\$ 520.00
6/9/2021	edited declaration, sent to client for signature	JC	0.6	\$ 650.00	\$ 390.00
6/14/2021	edited counsel declaration	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
6/17/2021	Reviewed additional briefing and declarations for approval, met with JC re same	KH	1.3	\$ 785.00	\$ 1,020.50
7/9/2021	Reviewed revised agreement, advised client re changes	JC	0.8	\$ 650.00	\$ 520.00
7/13/2021	Corr re client signature on settlement	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
7/20/2021	Reviewed ruling regarding MPA, research re mega settlement fee requests, sent to JC	SW	2.7	\$ 785.00	\$ 2,119.50
7/20/2021	reviewed joint report for appellate court, approved for filing	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
8/12/2021	client communications	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
8/13/2021	further corr re client update	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00

Aegis Law Firm  
Lodestar Report

<b>Date</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Atty</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Fees</b>
9/1/2021	reviewed email and client claim form from admin, advised client re filing claim	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
9/8/2021	corr w/co-counsel re fee motion	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
9/13/2021	corr with client re additional emails re claim form	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
9/13/2021	emailed admin re emails re claim form	JC	0.1	\$ 650.00	\$ 65.00
9/14/2021	further email with admin, updated client	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
9/14/2021	communications with client re declaration	JC	0.2	\$ 650.00	\$ 130.00
9/16/2021	drafted client declaration for enhancement	JC	0.8	\$ 650.00	\$ 520.00
9/16/2021	drafted Aegis declaration for fee request	JC	0.4	\$ 650.00	\$ 260.00
9/17/2021	finalized Aegis declaration	JC	0.3	\$ 650.00	\$ 195.00
	<b>Totals:</b>		<b>341.9</b>		<b>\$ 202,827.50</b>

# EXHIBIT B

# Matter Billing Detail

Report Date: 9/17/2021  
 Report Time: 4:53PM  
 Page: 1 of 3  
 User ID: Carlsen

## Aegis Law Firm, PC

Date Range: 01/01/1900 to 09/17/2021  
 Client: 50218 - Suhail Farran  
 Matter: 1236 - Farran v DoorDash, Inc

Date	Expense Code	Description	Debit	Credit	Billing Status	On Hold	Invoice Number	Check Number	Payee
		<b>Balance Forward:</b>	\$0.00						
05/15/2018	FF	Filing Fee - Complaint	\$1,484.51		Unbilled				
05/16/2018	FF	LWDA Filing Fee	\$75.00		Unbilled			5941	Department of Industrial Relatio
07/10/2018	FF	Filing Fee - Peremptory Challenge Pursuant to 170.6 CCP	\$12.20		Unbilled				
07/11/2018	FF	Filing Fee - Response to Doordash Inc's Petition to Compel Arbitration & Stay Proceedings	\$12.20		Unbilled				
07/16/2018	COU	Courier Charges-Account No. 8361	\$106.42		Unbilled			6014	DDS Legal Support Systems
07/16/2018	FF	Filing Fee - Motion for Leave to Amend Complaint	\$73.76		Unbilled				
08/27/2018	FF	Filing Fee - Motion for Leave to Amend	\$73.76		Unbilled				
09/06/2018	TRA	Travel to OCSC	\$15.37		Unbilled				
09/06/2018	TE	Travel Expenses - Parking at OCSC	\$4.00		Unbilled				
10/30/2018	FF	Filing Fee - Supplemental Brief re PAGA Claim	\$12.20		Unbilled				
10/30/2018	RES	Research Fee - Pulled documents from LASC	\$19.60		Unbilled				
10/30/2018	RES	Research Fee - PULled documents from LASC	\$21.60		Unbilled				
10/31/2018	RES	Research Fee - Pulled documents from LASC	\$16.80		Unbilled				
11/01/2018	FF	Filing Fee - Opposition	\$12.20		Unbilled				
11/08/2018	FF	Filing Fee - Notice of Withdrawal of Motion	\$12.20		Unbilled				
01/11/2019	FF	Filing Fee - Supplemental Opposition	\$12.20		Unbilled				
02/01/2019	FF	Filing Fee - Reply	\$12.20		Unbilled				
03/07/2019	RES	Database Research Fee - Pulled document from court	\$5.80		Unbilled				
03/07/2019	RES	Database Research Fee - PACER	\$0.90		Unbilled				
04/25/2019	FF	Filing Fee - Complaint	\$1,542.36		Unbilled				
05/22/2019	FF	Filing Fee - Request for Dismissal without Prejudice	\$12.20		Unbilled				
06/10/2019	FF	Filing Fee - Response	\$12.20		Unbilled				

# Matter Billing Detail

Report Date: 9/17/2021  
 Report Time: 4:53PM  
 Page: 2 of 3  
 User ID: Carlsen

## Aegis Law Firm, PC

Date	Expense Code	Description	Debit	Credit	Billing Status	On Hold	Invoice Number	Check Number	Payee
07/01/2019	FF	Filing Fee - Notice of Acknowledgment of Receipt	\$13.65		Unbilled				
08/02/2019	CTC	Court Call for Case Management Conference	\$94.00		Unbilled				
08/14/2019	FF	Filing Fee - Response	\$13.65		Unbilled				
08/22/2019	CR	Vendor: Network Deposition Services, Inc.; Date: 8/22/2019 - Court Reporting-Invoice A19010232	\$550.00		Unbilled			6568	Network Deposition Services, Inc
09/11/2019	FF	Filing Fee - Opposition, Declaration, Objection, Order, Proof of Service (Not Summons and Complaint)	\$13.65		Unbilled				
09/11/2019	FED	Federal Express - Opp to PTC Arb	\$28.11		Unbilled				
09/24/2019	TRA	Travel - Mileage to Hearing on Defendant's Petition to Compel Arb at LASC-Stanley Mosk	\$51.85		Unbilled				
09/24/2019	PAR	Parking - at Hearing on Defendant's Petition to Compel Arb at LASC-Stanley Mosk	\$20.00		Unbilled				
12/16/2019	FF	Filing Fee - Stipulation - Other, Proof of Service	\$32.86		Unbilled				
12/17/2019	FF	Filing Fee - Order-Other, Proposed Stipulation and Order	\$20.66		Unbilled				
12/17/2019	CTC	Court Call - Status Conference (Not Final)	\$94.00		Unbilled				
01/15/2020	CTC	Court Call - Motion	\$94.00		Unbilled				
01/29/2020	CTC	Court Call - Case Management Conference	\$94.00		Unbilled				
07/06/2020	CTC	Court Call-OSC	\$94.00		Unbilled				
01/14/2021	LC	LA Connect Appearance Fee-- OSC Dismissal	\$15.00		Unbilled				
04/23/2021	LC	LA Connect Appearance Fee - OSC	\$15.00		Unbilled				
09/17/2021	CC	Cumulative Copies, Faxes, Scans, Telephone Charges, Postage	\$2,345.25		Unbilled				
<b>Total:</b>			<u>\$7,139.36</u>	<u>\$0.00</u>					
<b>Balance:</b>			<u>\$7,139.36</u>						



# Matter Billing Detail

Report Date: 9/17/2021  
 Report Time: 4:53PM  
 Page: 3 of 3  
 User ID: Carlsen

## Aegis Law Firm, PC

Date	Expense Code	Description	Debit	Credit	Billing Status	On Hold	Invoice Number	Check Number	Payee
Total Fees Billed - - - - -			\$0.00						
Total Fees Unbilled : - - - - -			\$0.00						
Total Fees Received : - - - - -			\$0.00						
Total Soft Cost Billed : - - - - -			\$0.00						
Total Soft Cost Unbilled : - - - - -			\$0.00						
Total Soft Cost Received : - - - - -			\$0.00						
Total Hard Cost Billed : - - - - -			\$0.00						
Total Hard Cost Unbilled : - - - - -			\$7,139.36						
Total Hard Cost Received : - - - - -			\$0.00						
Total Taxes Billed : - - - - -			\$0.00						
Total Taxes Unbilled : - - - - -			\$0.00						
Total Taxes Received : - - - - -			\$0.00						
Total Late Charges Billed : - - - - -			\$0.00						
Total Late Charges Unbilled: - - - - -			\$0.00						
Total Late Charges Received : - - - - -			\$0.00						
Trust Balance: - - - - -			\$0.00						